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Preamble A, 6 Text 5 A sentence was deleted from the Working Procedures, 
as follows: 

“… Subsequently, relevant biological and 
epidemiological data are collected by IARC from 
recognized sources of information on carcinogenesis, 
including data storage and retrieval systems such as 
PubMed. Meeting participants who are asked to 
prepare preliminary working papers for specific 
sections are expected to supplement the IARC 
literature searches with their own searches. 

For most chemicals and some complex mixtures, the 
major collection of data and the preparation of 
working papers for the sections on chemical and 
physical properties, on analysis, on production and 
use, and on occurrence are carried out under a separate 
contract funded by the US National Cancer Institute. 
Industrial associations, labour unions and other 
knowledgeable organizations may be asked to provide 
input to the sections on production and use, although 
this involvement is not required as a general rule. 
Information on production and trade is obtained from 
governmental, trade and market research publications 
and, in some cases, by direct contact with industries. 
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…” 

Copyright page Cover Text and 
image 

– Copyright information was corrected and updated as 
follows: 

“This programme has been supported since 1982 
by Cooperative Agreement U01 CA33193 with the 
United States National Cancer Institute, Department of 
Health and Human Services. Additional support has 
been provided since 2014 by the European Union 
Programme for Employment and Social Innovation 
“EaSI” (2014–2020) (for further information please 
consult: http://ec.europa.eu/social/easi), and since 1992 
by the United States National Institute of 
Environmental Health Sciences, Department of Health 
and Human Services. The contents of this volume are 
solely the responsibility of the Working Group and do 
not necessarily represent the official views of the 
United States National Cancer Institute, the United 
States National Institute of Environmental Health 
Sciences, the United States Department of Health and 
Human Services, or the European Union.” 
--- 
The logo of the European Union was added, together 
with the text “Co-funded by the European Union” 
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3-Monochloro-
1,2-propanediol 

References Text 369–370 The following reference: 

“Cho WS, Han BS, Lee H et al. (2008). Subchronic 
toxicity study of 3-monochloropropane-1,2-diol 
administered by drinking water to B6C3F1 mice. Food 
Chem Toxicol, 46: 1666–1673. 
doi:10.1016/j.fct.2007.12.030 PMID:18328611” 

Was replaced with: 

“Cho WS, Han BS, Nam KT, Park K, Choi M, Kim SH, 
et al. (2008). Carcinogenicity study of 3-
monochloropropane-1,2-diol in Sprague-Dawley rats. 
Food Chem Toxicol, 46(9):3172–7. PMID:18680782 
http://dx.doi.org/10.1016/j.fct.2008.07.003” 
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